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Barbour County Commission

American Rescue Plan

Funds Request
2021-2022
Submit to: sfrey@ barbourcountywv.org Request #: /A
Organization Name: ARPID #:
Century Volga PSD ARP-2

Mailing Address:
946 Buckhannon Rd.
Philippi, WV 26416

Request date: (9/,0/(;10293

Funds Allocated: $249,000.00

Drawdown details:

QO Vendor Invoice # Amount
Funds Requested on this report: $ Q}LJ-‘ Y3568t vaesMain |RZY 700 S 235 50
20
Funds Requested to Date: $ A4 Y235 .66 :
]
Funds Available: $ 54556& e : 27 J3E
N - ota, :
¢ ?)L‘I Eled. GC Include copies of Invoices '
Internal Use:
Date Received: Account Number: Amount;

G- 1O-A

001-444-567-9003-1

+214 435, 20




Barbour County Commission

American Rescue Plan

Progress Report
FY 2021-2022

Describe your activity, progress, achievements, and difficulties encountered below. PLEASE BE DES(leFT!VE. A prégress report
Is due with each funds request. Emall submission of this report is preferred. Send to sfrey@barbourcountywv.org

Organization Name: ARP ID#

Century Volga PSD ARP-2

Mailing Address: Report Period:

946 Buckhannon Rd. May 19 2022,
Philippi, WV 26416

Report Completed By:

:llo:.:mo:dc #: goLgLJ-S'T-, 5735 Bewl. B
ma ress: v @ ool (
Date: S/I;/chg;‘ww DﬂdPSd

N‘f’pmﬂ@ Meters have been ordered | leadime on
delivery 1s 3 1o Y months . Nasckd 10 et orcer in
ASAPO get onthe. back loq of orders. Aease

grant reduest# | <o when imoiced we will have

e money o subit e paymentfor our order
Will PVC’VM@ Q copy oF e invoice as scon as We

. Wil e Invoiced when+e meers aretobd
livered. We will storehe meers at he PSD dfficeand
some &+ oursewage plant bui Idling




Sold To:

CENTURY VOLGA PSD
946 BUCKHANNON RD

INVOICE

Ship To:

CENTURY VOLGA PSD
946 BUCKHANNON ROAD

Customer # 153332

Order # QBB7004

Date Ordered 05/17/22

Job #

Job Name

Purchase Order #

Method of Shipment SHIPPED

Contract Order # 0000000

Ordered By

Ship Via THIRD PARTY
Branch:

MARTINSBURG WV
Branch - 514

PHILIPPI, WV 26416-1360 PHILIPPI, WV 26416 117 Industrial Circle
Martinsburg, Wv 25403
Phone: 304-263-6986
Bid Qty Qty Qty .
Seqg# Product Code Description Ordered Shipped B/O Net Price UOM Ext Price
NEPTUNE RADIQ READ METER
REPLACEMENT
*
4307ED2B31RPWG11S T10 5/8X3/4 USG R900I PROCODER 718 718 265.00000 EA 190270.00
W/ 6' ANT ED2B31RPWG115G89
/45016985489 BLUETOOTH BELT CLP TRANSCIEVER 1 1 5600.00000 EA 5600.00
/45016985491 ADVANTAGE II WAND 1 1 1700.00000 EA 1700.00
/45016985492 MRX920 DRIVE BY MOBILE 1§ 1 12000.00000 EA 12000.00
READING DEVICE
/45016985495 NEPTUNE 36 SOFTWARE ANNUAL 1 3 2400.00000 EA 2400.00
SUBSCRIPTION
/45016985516 NEPTUNE 360 ONE-TIME SOFTWARE 1 1 2000.00000 EA 2000.00
SET UP FEE
/45016985519 CORE & MAIN SOFTWARE/HARDWARE 1 1 N/C EA
TRAINING
FREIGHT FREIGHT 1 1 465.20000 EA 465.20
Terms in accordance with shipping manifest.
Special Instructions/Comments :
FOB: SHIPPING POINT S

TERMS: NET 30 DAYS

Total Shipped:

Total Ordered: 214435.20

(_214435.20 [
\“‘———-__,_ e 2=




Application #:
Organization:

ARP-2

Funds Request Log

Century Volga PSD

Funds Allocated: $249,000.00
Bk Request # Funds- Requested | Funds Requested to Funds Avallable
this report date
06/10/2022 1 $214,435.20 $214,435.20 $34,564.80
2 $0.00 $214,435.20 $34,564.80
3 $0.00 $214,435.20 $34,564.80
4 $0.00 $214,435.20 $34,564.80
5 $0.00 $214,435.20 $34,564.80
6 $0.00 $214,435.20 $34,564.80
Checks $0.00

$0.00




$214,435.20

$214,435.20



Shana Frez

From: Shana Frey <sfrey@barbourcountywv.org>
Sent: Tuesday, May 24, 2022 2:35 PM

To: ‘centuryvolgapsd@aol.com'

Subject: RE: ARP Funds Request No. 1

The attached quote indicated Net 30 payment terms. Quotes can’t be paid from so when the invoice is received, funds
will be released.

Let me know if you have any questions.

Shana

From: centuryvolgapsd@aol.com <centuryvolgapsd@aol.com>
Sent: Thursday, May 19, 2022 1:23 PM

To: sfrey@barbourcountywv.org

Subject: ARP Funds Request No. 1

Shana,
Attached, please find our ARP Funds Request No. 1, for our Neptune Meters in which the order was placed 05/19/22.

Thank You,

Judy S. Edge
Manager

Century Volga Public Service District
946 Buckhannon Road

Philippi, WV 26416

Phone: (304) 457-5735

Fax:  (304) 457-5420

email: centuryvolgapsd@aol.com

Privileged and Confidential This communication and any accompanying documents are confidential and privileged. They are intended for the sole use
of the addressee. If you receive this transmission in error, you are advised that any disclosure, copying, distribution, or the taking of any action in
reliance upon this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please contact the above party at the email
address.



Barbour County Commission

American Rescue Plan Vo
Funds Request , D

2021-2022
} ® 4
Submit to: sfrey@barbourcountywv.org Request #:
,(O Organization Name: ARP ID #:
Century Volga PSD ARP-2
Mailing Address: Request date: Y
946 Buckhannon Rd. 5/ 'q IZO
Philippi, WV 26416
Funds Allocated: $249,000.00 Drawdown details:
0 Vendor Invoice # Amount
Funds Requested on this report: $ A 14 CCO. O re ¢« Main | 2lie]23 Guote [ 5 Al 000. 00
< v
Funds Requested to Date: $.2/44- 000 OO <
Funds Available: 000. 00V 5
&s 35 Total | $ 218 000.0
Include copies of Invoices

Internal Use:

Date Received: Account Number: Amount:
- 001-444-567-9003-1
R

T g
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Barbour County Commission

American Rescue Plan

Submit to: sfrey@ barbourcountywv.org

Funds Request
2021-2022

Vo I D Request #: la

Organization Name: ARPID #:

Century Volga PSD ARP-2

Mailing Address: Request date: (,, /I ) / 2022,
946 Buckhannon Rd.

Philippi, WV 26416

Funds Allocated: $249,000.00

Funds Available: $ 3) CL5.CO

Funds Requested to Date; $ Al4 4235 00

Drawdown details:

Funds Requested on this report:$ Qi 435 00 (cve ¢ Main
. :

Vendor Invoice # Amount
QEZ700¥ : Y435 36
S
S

Total | $ 214 435,

Include copies of Invoices

"

Internal Use:

Date Received:

Account Number:

Amount:

001-444-567-9003-1

VOID



117 Industrial Blvd Ya
Martinsburg, WV. 25401 E A
304-263-6986 i

February 16, 2022

Century Volga PSD
946 Buckhannon Road
Philippi, WV 26416
Attention: Judy Edge
Neptune Radio Read Meter Replacemen

Item uanti Description Price Extended
1 700 5/8x3/4” T10 Meter with ProCoder R900i  $ 265.00 $ 185,500.00
w/ 6° Pit Antenna
2 20 5/8 ProCoder R900i Register with 6’ Antenna $ 240.00 $ 4,800.00
3 1 Bluetooth Belt Clip Transceiver $ 5,600.00 $ 5,600.00
4 1 Advantage II Wand $1,700.00 $1,700.00
5 1 MRX920 Drive by Mobile Reading Device $ 12,000.00 $12,000.00
6 1 Neptune 360 Software Annugl Subscription  § 2,400.00 $2,400.00
7 1 Neptune 360 One - time Software Set up Fee §$ 2,000.00 $2,000.00
8 1 Core & Main Software / Hardware Training N/C N/C
TOTAL $ 214,000.00

FOB: Shipping Point
NET: 30 Days

*** As of, 2/11/2022, Neptune is quoting Mid May Delivery Dates on meters — this is subject to
change daily ***

VOID

Jeff Potter
Core & Main

Neptune Meter System Product Specialist
304-575-2421




. C36882 STKOXO7 07/25/2021 20:38 -1982-
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No. 35888
Check Number 35888 Vendor No CENTURY-V  Check Date 07/12/2022  Amount 214,435.20 %
Invaice No P ONo Quantity Invoice Amt Description . Invoice No PO No Quantity Invoice Amt Description
cv71122 0.00 214,435.20 aRP =~ 2)
1
i
[
# Check Number 35888 Vendor No CENTURY-V  Check Date 07/12/2022 Amount  214,435.20 No. 35888 |
} Invoice No PONo Quantity Invoice Amt Description Invoice No P O No Quantity Invoice Amt  Description ;
3 cvriizz 0.00 214,435.20 ARP
3
H |
3
i
5
?
3
H
f
3
§
!
{
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~ — - ————— - = i i (-3
o . No... .= -
CLERK OF THE BARBOUR COUNTY COMMISSION e FfQEdom' o . 35888
26'NORTH MAIN- ,«_,M : RS -
PHILIPPI WV 26416 T e9.437/515 . T, T=S o
IDENTIFICATION NUMBER " DATE CHECKNUMBER ' '° - ' NETAMOUNT
CENTURY-V 001 - 07/12/2022 o 35?88 ‘ . :'2_14, 435 '.2'0. . . .
two- hundied fourteen thowsond four hundred thirty -five and 20 /100 -- 3
e = . - :
- GENERAL COUNTY FUND -~ _ 3
CENTURY-VOLGA P.S.D. N I 5 THE SHERIFF OF BARBOUR COUNTY - .8
BAY 946 BUCKHANNON ROAD ; ’ : * g s . ke 8
TO THE

ORDER OF PHILIPPI WV 264161360

"*O35ABB" 1205450L3771 ioocaoaar/ ) }




